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SAFETY AND PUBLIC WORKS COMMITTEE MINUTES 
FRIDAY, JULY 10, 2020 

8:00 AM 
VIA ZOOM MEETING 

 
Members Present: Robert Zimmerman, Council Chairperson 
   Sean Malone, Council Member 
   Carmella Williams, Council Member 

Earl Williams, Council Member 
   Jonathan Hren, Citizen Member 
   James Sammon, Citizen Member 
   Kimberly Harris, Citizen Member 
   Patricia Speese, Director Public Works 
   Patrick Sweeney, Chief of Fire 
   Jeffrey DeMuth, Chief of Police 
 
Others Present: Mayor David E. Weiss 

Jeri Chaikin, Chief Administrative Officer 
  Kelly Baker, Recording Assistant 

   Barbara Bradley, League of Women Voters 
   
 
The meeting was called to order by Council Chair Robert Zimmerman at 8:02 am. 
 
APPROVAL OF JUNE 5, 2020 MEETING MINUTES  
Council Chair Zimmerman asked if there were any questions, changes or additions to the June 5, 
2020, Safety and Public Works Committee minutes. There being none a motion was made by Citizen 
Member Hren, it was seconded, and the minutes were approved. 
 
RECOMMENDATION FOR 2020 & 2021 FLOW MONITORING AND FIELD 
SERVICES FOR ILLICIT DISHCHARGE DETECTION ELLIMINATION (IDDE) 
Patricia Speese, Director of Public Works 
Director Speese explained how Public Works has been aggressively pursuing sewer improvements 
throughout the city for the past several years.  She stated that one task that has proven invaluable is 
flow monitoring which helps determine how much infiltration is getting into the sewer system that 
shouldn’t.  Then when the improvements are made, the monitoring tells us what the improvement 
rate is showing how much we have reduced the Inflow and Infiltration (I & I).   
 
Director Speese stated that we have done this for the two Sanitary Sewer Overflow’s (SSO) that we 
have remediated in the city and we have in the past just done this one at a time. (going out for a 
price and awarding it )  She stated that another valuable part of this happens when we apply for a 
grant.  We don’t know the amount of I & I when we are applying for the grant and this information 
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could help us obtain more grants.  She stated that it would be much better and more cost effective 
to go out for a proposal for this service so we have a firm on hand when needed.   
 
Director Speese described how they submitted proposals to four firms and received two back.  They 
used the quality based evaluation process which is when they firms submit the proposal and the fee 
is separate in a sealed envelope, the proposal is reviewed based on its merits before looking at the 
price.  AECOM was selected on their merits and they were also the lowest price. She stated that we 
are saving approximately 30% on cost by having them under contract.  Director Speese is 
recommending approval to proceed with this request for proposal to award AECOM for flow 
monitoring and field services.  
 
Council Chair Zimmerman ask if there were any questions about the recommendation.  Council 
Member Malone asked if the firm we used last year was AECOM and Director Speese stated that 
the city has used AECOM, GPD and the County in the past.  He also asked if she knew why there 
was only two bids received.  Director Speese stated that it is not a high task job and referred to 
Citizen Member Hren who has a firm that does this type of work.  Citizen Member Hren stated that 
his firm saw it online but this type of work is specialized and not glamorous and so they did not 
pursue a bid.   
 
Council Chair Zimmerman asked for a motion to approve this item.  A motion was made by Citizen 
Member Malone and it was seconded so the motion was approved to move on to council. 
 
 
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT UPDATE 
Patricia Speese, Director of Public Works 
Director Speese gave an update regarded COVID-19 related.  She stated that we did receive the 
Clorox 360 machines that we ordered with the School District.  They are an electrostatic sanitizing 
machine with a wand and have been used heavily in the Police department and the Court as well as 
the Fire department and Public Works and will be used throughout various city buildings and have 
been really helpful.  Director Speese stated that the Plexi-glass shields have all been made and 
installed for various departments throughout the entire city.  Getting Plexi-Glass was a big challenge 
due to a shortage.   
 
Director Speese mentioned that we are meeting with the Northeast Ohio Regional Sewer District 
about Horseshoe Lake Improvements which appear to be more than was anticipated and more 
information will be forthcoming.   
 
Director Speese shared a story about Citizen Member Hren who several weeks ago,  was 
participating in the event, when there was construction going on in the Service Yard and Large Item 
Drop off had to be moved across the street to the parking lot on Saturday. The department had two 
of its extremely conscientious and friendly employees manning the event (Chaun Shell and Al 
Aikens, Jr.).  An irate resident who was berating them and yelling at them on how inconvenient it 
was for him by having to go across the street instead of the yard.  The two employees were very 
much taken aback and then another resident, Jonathan Hren, came into the conversation and told 
the irate resident to back off and not to treat the city employees in that manner.  Director Speese 
stated that we appreciate Jonathan Hren and his support and thanked him for his heroic stance for 
our employees.  Citizen Hren stated that he appreciated the Director for bringing this up.  He 
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described his behavior as a natural reaction to speak up for people who are working for our city.  He 
stated that no one should be disrespected that way and he was happy to help.   
 
Director Speese continued to say everything is moving along fine, all the street resurfacing and 
waterline projects are wrapping up.  It is our busy season and we are staying on or ahead of 
schedule. 
 
POLICE DEPARTMENT UPDATE 
Jeff DeMuth, Police Chief 
Chief DeMuth stated that during this pandemic we are realizing that operationally within the 
department we are realizing that a lot of the support personnel cannot work entirely at home and 
have to be in the office for one reason or another and we are working through the adjustments 
required to meet the department needs and the team’s safety.  He stated that the outside operations 
are nowhere near what they were but the traffic is increasing.  He stated they are very very busy 
from a call-to-service standpoint.   
 
Chief DeMuth talked about the Clorox machine and how they used it to sanitize the training room 
so we can resume in-service training.  He stated the machine has been invaluable.  Chief DeMuth 
spoke about another machine called the Moon Beam Machine that throws out UV light to kill the 
virus.  He spoke of a critical incident that they responded to where the victim tested positive 
COVID-19 which five officers and five detectives were exposed to because of assisting and 
interviewing the victim.  Also all the evidence had to be sanitized and the Clorox 360 Machine is 
perfect for that task. 
 
FIRE DEPARTMENT UPDATE 
Patrick Sweeney, Fire Chief 
Chief Sweeney started his report stating the Fire Department has a steady number of patients every 
week that they are transporting to the hospital that are positive patients.  We receives notification 
from the hospital so the crews are diligent with using the correct PPE and using the Clorox 360 
machine.  He stated that the Moon Beam Machine will be part of the department’s regular routine as 
well.   
 
Chief Sweeney stated that the PPE supplies are sufficient.  He stated that each time they are 
transporting a positive patient he reaches out to the entire crew to make sure they wore the 
appropriate PPE and he uses it as a tool to remind them not to get complacent.  Chief Sweeney said 
he is waiting to hear about a number of grants they applied for that will allow them to replenish a lot 
of the PPE.  He also stated that they began training again with University Hospital who brings in 
physicians and instructor to maintain their continuing education requirements.   
 
Chief Sweeney talked about the fires in the Heights areas.  Stated that there have been a number of 
significant fires, mentioning a few on Pennington that would most likely be raised in the near future.   
He stated that he was appreciative that to date no one has been infected in the department.   
 
Council Chair Zimmerman asked if the Chief felt there were more fires because more people are 
home for more time and the Chief didn’t believe that was the case.   
 
Chief DeMuth added information about the protests and rallies in the area and during this time the 
Police department has had to mobilize many officers, up to 30 at times, for the safety and security 
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for all those involved, for the City of Shaker Heights as well as surrounding areas.  He stated he is 
grateful no one has been infected during those times.   
 
UPDATE FROM THE MAYOR 
Mayor David E. Weiss 
Mayor Weiss talked about the mask requirements and the commentary regarding the use of masks.  
He stated that the businesses were required to wear them but the patrons were not, unless the 
business required them to.  Now that the spike in cases over the past two weeks, there is talk of 
closing the gap of requiring masks.  He stated the question is who has the authority to do 
something.  He is hopeful and encouraged that the governor’s office would take action and initially 
they did not and so we were looking at what the county might do and what we can do at the city 
level.    
 
Council Member Earl Williams asked the Mayor about the money the city received from the CARES 
Act and how it would be appropriated so that we would not have to return unused funds.   He asked 
if the mayor could advises us when and where the money would be used.  The Mayor advised that 
the CARES Act money were earmarked for passage from federal government to the state and from 
the state to local governments.  Each state had the discretion on how to use the funds with 
restrictions.  The City of Shaker Heights received about $760,000.  The requirement is that these 
monies are used specifically for COVID related expenses.  There are still a lot of conversations as to 
getting clarification on what is considered COVID related.  Some items are clear such as the Clorox 
and Moon Beam machines, others were more confusing such as allocations of salaries of first 
responders dealing with COVID patients and it’s still not clear and there is a lack of guidance from 
the federal government.   The Mayor stated he is confident that we will use all the funds.  
 
Citizen Member Harris asked Chief DeMuth if the department is supplied with masks that they are 
ready to share with the community when they have encounters with them.  Chief DeMuth stated 
that there is enough supply for the department’s internal use and masks that they will supply to the 
public at the station, but currently they are not dispersing them on the streets.  Citizen Member 
Harris asked if they were encountering residents that don’t have masks when they are dealing with 
the community.  Chief DeMuth stated he does not know the rate of residents wearing masks or not. 
The Mayor stated that initially there was a shortfall and that at the beginning of the pandemic it was 
much less an option to hand out masks. He stated it was a great suggestion and that it would clearly 
quality for the funds for the CARES Act funding that were discussed. 
 
The Mayor talked about the city’s concern for a need for response to situations involving mental 
health issues. He stated this has been on our radar for some time and while the training of our 
officers has increased over time, the bottom line is they are not social workers, trained psychologists, 
or medical professionals who know about proper medication doses.  The Mayor stated he would like 
this committee to address this topic and start putting together gathered information in one location.  
He has already begun collecting information and has had conversation with Council Member Earl 
Williams on this issue.   
 
Council Member Earl Williams stated that he appreciated the Mayor commenting on the 
opportunities in the area.  He stated that his small practice representing probate court psychiatric 
hearings.  He mentioned the Crisis Intervention Training organization (CIT) who are active with the 
Cleveland Police department and respond to situations where this are psychiatric or other issues.  He 
just wanted to make sure the City of Shaker Heights knew this resource was available.   



 

 5 

 
The Mayor suggested that the information should be vetted through this committee and that Kelly 
Baker can keep all the information in one location.   
 
Council Chair Zimmerman thanked everyone for participating.   
 
Meeting adjourned at 8:55 am. 
 
 
________________________________________ 
Robert Zimmerman, Council Chairperson 
Safety & Public Works Committee 

 
 
 



 

 

Memorandum 
 
TO:   Safety and Public Works Committee Members 
 
FROM: Joyce Braverman, Director of Planning 
 
CC:  David E. Weiss, Mayor  

Jeri Chaikin, Chief Administrative Officer 
 
SUBJECT: Warrensville Center Streetscape Improvements  

Construction Administration/Inspection Services Contract Amendment 
 
DATE: August 3, 2020 
 
 
 
This is a recommendation to amend and extend a professional services contract with Greenman-
Pederson, Inc. (GPI) for construction inspection and administration of the Warrensville Center 
Road Streetscape Improvements project. This type of consultant is required by the Ohio 
Department of Transportation (ODOT) when Federal funding is involved in a project, and acts as 
the City’s onsite construction manager and inspector for the duration of the project. 
 
Primary streetscape construction activities include concrete sidewalks, curbs, asphalt pavement, 
ADA ramp installation, pedestrian lighting, landscaping and signage along the east side of 
Warrensville between Scottsdale and Farnsleigh, and along the north side of Farnsleigh between 
Warrensville and Thornton Park.  
 
GPI was originally selected in 2019 and the contract was approved by Council in April 2019 through 
Ordinance 19-33. GPI was chosen through a Request for Qualifications which was posted on the 
ODOT website for three weeks per ODOT consultant contract administration requirements 
beginning March 11, 2019. Six letters of interest were submitted by the April 1 deadline. A selection 
committee reviewed the letters of interest and ranked them according to ODOT criteria. 
 
GPI submitted a cost proposal in the total amount of $233,949. The original contract is effective 
through August 1, 2020. The construction job was originally to be complete by June 1, 2020. Perk 
has completed 98% of the work. However, their sub-consultant, Trafftech, has experienced delays 
due to delivery issues related to COVID-19 and is behind in securing parts for the job. Since the 
construction is delayed, GPI’s work inspecting and managing the job needs to be extended. GPI has 
requested an additional fee of $8589.00 to complete the job. This will bring the amended contract to 
$242,533.00. The additional fee is based on the cost of labor for the construction inspector and 
construction engineer and on the number of anticipated hours to inspect the contractor’s work. 
 
 
 
 



 

2 

 
 
Recommendation 
This is a recommendation to amend a professional services contract with Greenman-Pederson, Inc. 
(GPI) for construction inspection and administration of the Warrensville Center Road Streetscape 
Improvements project by $8,589.00 for a not-to-exceed amount of $242,533.00. 
 
The contract will be funded with Shaker Heights capital funds for Van Aken District construction, 
which were appropriated via Ordinance 08-87 and 08-127. Federal grant funds will also be used to 
reimburse this expense up to 80%.  
 

 



 

 

Memorandum 

To:  Members of Public Works Committee  

From:  Joyce G. Braverman, Director of Planning, Planning  

  Kara Hamley O’Donnell, Principal Planner, Planning 

cc:  Mayor David E. Weiss 
  Chief Administrative Officer Jeri E. Chaikin 

Date:   August 6, 2020 

Re:   ODOT HSIP Grant—Warrensville Center Road-S. Woodland Road intersection 

 
 
This is a request to authorize a grant application to, and to accept a grant from, the Ohio 
Department of Transportation (ODOT) Highway Safety Improvement Program (HSIP) Safety 
Grant.  The Ohio Department of Transportation dedicates about $102 million annually for 
engineering improvements at high-crash and severe-crash locations for ODOT staff and local 
governments to make improvements on any public roadway. 
 
The Planning Department will apply for a grant not to exceed $275,000 to pay for engineering 
and implementation of pedestrian and infrastructure improvements at the South Woodland 
Road intersection with Warrensville Center Road, as recommended in the 2018 Van Aken 
District Signal Study prepared by HNTB. This dangerous intersection has various geometric and 
traffic operational issues that negatively affect travel for motorists, pedestrians, and cyclists. The 
often-congested intersection is located within a block of the GCRTA Green line rapid stop and 
Shaker Middle School, to which many students walk and bike. In the past 3 years, unfortunate 
accidents have resulted including two fatalities from an automobile accident. 
 
Proposed traffic changes will result in curb changes and reduce the number of signal phases 
and the required cycle length, which will reduce vehicle delays. It will allow a shorter crosswalk 
length.  Installing a new controller capable of supporting nine phases will allow the intersection 
to operate in a fully-actuated mode, which will improve the overall operational efficiency and 
further reduce delays. Restriping the South Woodland approaches to provide exclusive left turn 
lanes and providing actuated, lead-left phasing will address problems with through-traveling 
traffic being blocked by turning vehicles. Providing two through lanes in the westbound 
direction will maximize the existing intersection capacity and reduce queue lengths for the 
heaviest direction of travel.  
 
The proposed countermeasures improve operations, reduce driver confusion, and improve 
safety for all users -bikes, pedestrians and cars - by creating a more conventional intersection, 
reducing pedestrian crossing distance/time, rerouting pedestrians to crosswalks that are more 
visible to oncoming traffic, and improving intersection geometry. Pulling in curb returns and 
landscaping existing paved areas will reduce the overall intersection area, shorten pedestrian 
crossing distance and time, and reduce bicycle clearance times. 
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Proposed Warrensville Center Road/South Woodland Road improvements will complete the 
recommendations of the 2018 Van Aken District Signal Study which recommended 
improvements to Warrensville Center Road’s intersections with Shaker Boulevard, South 
Woodland Road and Farnsleigh Road, as well as changes to the Chagrin Boulevard/Lynnfield 
Road and Farnsleigh Road/Van Aken Boulevard/Shaker Plaza Drive intersections.  All 
improvements, with the exception of Warrensville Center Road/South Woodland, have been, 
or will be, completed this year. 
 
This is a request to authorize a grant application to ODOT for $275,000 for engineering and 
construction; City payment of approximately $12,500 for Construction 
Management/Construction Inspection (CMCI) and a 10% local match is required, resulting in a 
$40,000 City cost for this project. This $40,000 was in the 2020 Capital Budget, but was 
deferred as part of the $5 million+ of expenses removed from the budget due to projected 
revenue losses. If we get the grant, the $40,000 match would come from the $1.5+ million 
balance in the General Capital Fund. 
 
ODOT’s HSIP grant applications under $500,000 are accepted on a rolling basis, though the 
large-project grant deadline is September 30; we propose to work with City Engineer GPD to 
submit application for this reimbursable grant in early September in hopes of an expedited 
review.  This may also permit the project implementation to be coordinated with Warrensville 
Center Road repaving scheduled for 2021.  
 
 
Recommendation  
This is a request for the Public Works Committee to recommend Council authorization of an 
application for, and acceptance of, a grant up to $275,000 from ODOT. A $40,000 match is 
required, and sufficient funds would need to be budgeted from the capital budget to meet this 
requirement.   
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Memorandum 

To:  Members of Safety & Public Works Committee  

From:  Patricia Speese, Director, Public Works 
 
cc:  David E. Weiss, Mayor 
  Jeri E. Chaikin, CAO 
 
Date:   August 3, 2020 

Re:   Enter into Agreement with Kimble Transfer & Recycling for processing of 
recyclables 

 
 

In May Council approved the participation of the City in the Cuyahoga County Solid Waste 
Districts (CCSWD) Consortium request for competitive bids for recycling processing. The Cities of 
Beachwood, Cleveland Heights, Independence, Lyndhurst, Pepper Pike, Shaker Heights, Solon, 
University Heights, Warrensville Heights and the Villages of Moreland Hills, Highland Hills and 
Woodmere are participating in the recycling consortium.  
 
The recycling market has gone down considerably over the past several years and the consortium 
members were aware that paying for disposal of recyclables was inevitable.  

 
The CCSWD sought an Invitation to Bid in the Plain Dealer on May 31, 2020 and June 3, 2020 for 
recycling processing services. Only received two bids were received for this service; Kimble 
Transfer and Recycling (our current vendor) and Rumpke Waste and Recycling Co.  
 
Prior to going out to bid, the Public Works Directors of the participating communities requested 
that we bid out the processing of recyclables which are collected in blue bags separately. All but 
two of the communities prohibit this type of disposal so we felt that since the cost of processing 
is more when blue bags are involved, it would benefit the majority to do it this way.  
 
Another topic that was discussed at great length was the volatility in the recycling market and 
did we want to be locked into a five-year contract which we have done for the past ten years. As 
a result of this discussion we felt it was in everyone’s best interest to solicit bids for two-years 
with two additional one-year renewals for a grand total of four years.  
 
The cost for processing recyclables in blue bags started at $96.00 a ton all the way to $126.08 a 
ton. Since Shaker Heights uses recycling buckets we will not be paying these additional costs. 
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The bids for processing loose recyclables are as follows: 
 
 
        
   
   
   
   
   
   
   
   
   
   
   
   
      
Any load with an estimated contamination rate of 22% or more will be rejected at the facility. 
The good news with the lowest bidder, Kimble Transfer & Recycling is that we have been using 
them for the past five-years with great results. Each community will enter into their own contract 
with Kimble Transfer & Recycling. 
 
Anticipating that we would begin paying for processing of recyclables when our current contract 
expires in September $30,000 was included in the 2020 budget and should be sufficient to cover 
these costs for the final four months of the year. Our yearly costs will be in the $90,000 range. 
The cost to landfill solid waste currently costs $47 a ton and will be $48.50 in 2022 and $50.00 in 
2023. 
 
Based on the results of the competitive bidding process and our experience with the low bidder, 
it is recommended that Kimble Transfer & Recycling be awarded the contract for processing 
recyclables at a cost of $69 a ton for year one; $71.07 a ton for year two; $73.20 for optional year 
one and $76.13 a ton for option year two. 
 
 

Recycling Processing Services (loose materials) 

Bidder 
Yr 1 
Price/ton  

Yr 2 
Price/ton  

Option Yr 
1 
Price/Ton 

Option Yr 2 
Price/Ton 

Kimble  $      69.00   $     71.07   $      73.20   $        76.13  

Republic/BFI  no bid   no bid   no bid   no bid  

Rumpke  $    120.00   $   120.00   $    123.00   $     126.08  

WMI  no bid   no bid   no bid   no bid  



 
 

 

 

Memorandum 

To:  Members of Safety & Public Works Committee 

From:  Patricia Speese, Public Works Director 

cc:  David E. Weiss, Mayor 
  Jeri E. Chaikin, CAO 
 
Date:   August 3, 2020 

Re:   Enter into an Agreement between Cuyahoga County for the emergency repair of 
South Woodland Culvert No. 3 

 
 
In the spring of 2020, Public Works staff noticed a large sinkhole had started to develop along the 
curb line and catch basin in the general area of 23450 S. Woodland (just east of Green Road). 
Further investigation revealed the sink hole was a result of the 3-foot x 7-foot box culvert running 
under S. Woodland having collapsed. This culvert conveys storm water from the Shaker Blvd. 
median, travels in a southerly direction and outlets at Green Rd. & Bryden Road. This is the 
upstream portion of the Mill Creek Watershed.  
 
Understanding time was of the essence, Public Works removed trees on the outlet side of the culvert 
in the spring of 2020 to avoid any conflicts with ODNR and the prohibitions with tree removal to 
protect the Indiana Bat. The design was started shortly thereafter. The general scope of the project 
consists of replacing the culvert under S. Woodland, grading of the outlet area, installation of new 
headwall / wing walls, placement of rock channel protection and restoration. The engineer’s 
construction cost estimate is $251,416.55; bids were received July 31, 2020 and are being reviewed 
but fall within this estimate. 
 
Since South Woodland is a County road, we reached out to the County to see if they could provide 
any emergency financial aid to protect South Woodland Road. The County Council approved this 
request and are able to provide 50% of the cost up to $100,000 for the replacement of this culvert. 
 
We recommend entering into an Agreement with Cuyahoga County for the emergency repair of the 
South Woodland Culvert No. 3 at a contribution rate of 50% up to a maximum of $100,000. 
 
 
 
 



 

 

 
 
 
 
To:  Members of Safety and Public Works 
 
From:  Patrick Sweeney, Chief of Fire 
 
C:  David E. Weiss, Mayor 
  Jeri E. Chaikin, CAO 
 
Date:  August 7, 2020 
 
RE:  Assistance to Firefighters Grant – COVID-19 Supplemental Program 
 
 
The Shaker Heights Fire Department, on behalf of 33 communities in Cuyahoga County, made 
application for a FEMA Assistance to Firefighters (AFG) COVID-19 Grant.  This AFG grant 
became available during the early stages of the current pandemic emergency to provide funding to 
Fire Departments in need of procuring personal protective equipment for Firefighters responding to 
the medical needs of citizens who may be infected with COVID-19. 
 
As with many FEMA Grant opportunities, making application through a regional partnership as 
opposed to a single agency application, in a coordinated manner, has a higher likelihood of being 
approved for federal funding. In doing so, one municipality needs to be willing to take the lead on 
the application process and act as the fiduciary for the group if the application is approved for 
federal funding.   After discussing this with Shaker Administration, the Shaker Heights Fire 
Department agreed to be the lead agency in making the grant application along with acting as the 
fiduciary for any awarded grant funds.   
 
While completing the grant application, a total of 33 Fire Departments in Cuyahoga County 
requested to be a part of the grant request and via a memorandum of understanding, agreed to 
reimburse Shaker Heights for their portion of a required 10% grant match.  The total federal grant 
request for the 33 communities is $177,487.68 with a total applicant match (10%) of $17,748.77.  
This equates to a total project amount of $195,236.45 for the purchase of COVID-19 personal 
protective equipment.  This equipment consists of N95 masks, Surgical Masks, Eye Protection, Shoe 
Covers, and Gowns.  This equipment has been identified as essential for Firefighters providing 
emergency medical care to residents in our communities. 
 
With much assistance from the Law Department, a memorandum of understanding was drawn up 
between the City of Shaker Heights and all other participating communities.  This MOU outlines the 
grant application process, what the grant funding will provide to each department, and required a 
representative from each department to acknowledge, via signature, the required match that will 
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need to be reimbursed back to the City of Shaker Heights.  The reimbursement process will be 
initiated via an invoice generated to each municipality from the Fire Department.    
  
The Fire Department recommends that The Safety and Public Works Committee accept the 
awarded $177,487.68 FEMA AFG COVID-19 funds.  Additionally, the Safety and Public Works 
Committee is requested to recommend to the Finance Committee to accept the FEMA Grant funds 
and appropriate the total project cost of $195,236.45 to the Fire Department operating budget.  This 
will allow the fire department to start the procurement process of this critical protective equipment 
as expeditiously as possible.    All of this appropriation request will be reimbursed to the City of 
Shaker Heights with the exception of $868.34 which is the required match from Shaker Heights Fire 
Department.    

 
 




